
Dark Wolf Solutions Wins Google Cloud Public Sector Partner of the Year for North America -
US Federal - Department of Defense.

Herndon, VA – April 8, 2024 — Dark Wolf Solutions, LLC (Dark Wolf), a leading provider of
Google Cloud professional services, announced today that it has been recognized as the 2024
Google Cloud Public Sector Partner of the Year for North America - US Federal - Department of
Defense (DoD).

Dark Wolf is being honored for its outstanding achievements in helping DoD customers achieve
success with Google Cloud. The company has a proven track record delivering innovative and
secure solutions that meet the unique needs of government organizations facing critical national
security challenges.

“Google Cloud's Partner Awards celebrate the transformative impact and value that partners
have delivered for customers," said Kevin Ichhpurani, Corporate Vice President, Global
Ecosystem and Channels at Google Cloud. "We're proud to announce Dark Wolf Solutions as a
2024 Google Cloud Partner Award winner and recognize their achievements enabling customer
success from the past year.”

“We are thrilled to be recognized as the Google Cloud Public Sector Partner of the Year for the
Department of Defense,” said Rick Tossavainen, CEO of Dark Wolf. “Aligning with our
customer-first ethos, this award is a testament to our team’s hard work and dedication to work
with our partners and help our customers achieve their mission.”

“Google Cloud brings world-class technology, scale, and innovation into the hands of our joint
customers,” said Matt Munsch, Director of Dark Wolf’s Google Cloud Delivery team. “We are
very proud of the outcomes we’ve driven this year ‘bringing Google Cloud to the Mission’. We
have had success helping our customers achieve Authority to Operate (ATO) on both Google
Workspace and Google Cloud. Dark Wolf is scaling our Google Cloud Delivery team to keep up
with the growing demand for Google Cloud and Google Workspace for our National Security
and Defense customers.”

About Dark Wolf
Dark Wolf is a leading provider of cyber security, software development, and specialized mission
support to national security clients and Fortune 500 customers. They combine emerging
technologies with industry expertise to meet their clients’ needs in DevSecOps, full-stack Agile
software development, penetration testing and incident response, applied research and rapid
prototyping, machine learning, engineering, and consulting services. They are committed to
helping their customers achieve their mission goals and are proud to be a Google Cloud
Partner.


